

BID OPENING REGISTER

BID NO: DESCRIPTION: PROVISION OF SECURITY SERVICES AT THE CIDB PROVINCIAL
RFB60467 OFFICES FOR THE PERIOD OF 36 MONTHS

CLOSING DATE: 20 JUNE 2016

CLOSING TIME:11:00

BID NO:	BID PRICE	COMPANY NAME	CLAIMED BBBEE POINTS
1	R 3,569,731.16	VUSA ISIZWE SECURITY	LEVEL 2
2	R 6,088,918.16	IBUTHOLENTOMBI SECURITY SERVICES	LEVEL 3
3	R 3,709,954.50	IMVULA QUALITY PROTECTION(AFRICA)	LEVEL 2
4	R 21,395,374.31	MODISE PROTECTION SERVICES	LEVEL 1
5	R 2,857,745.30	SMADA SECURITY SERVICES	LEVEL 2
6	R 41,413,389.49	MOTHIBA PHATLHA SECURITY SERVICES	LEVEL 1
7	R 6,945,794.60	BATLHOKOMEDI MANAGEMENT SERVICES	LEVEL 1
8	R 9,477,169.24	MATOME AND MOLOTO PROTECTION SERVICES	LEVEL 1
9	NO BID PRICE	SINQOBILE EQUESTRIAN SECURITRY SERVICES	NON COMPLIANT
10	NO BID PRICE ON COVER PAGE	MUNUCHI INVESTMENT AND PROJECTS	LEVEL 1
11	R 3,114,655.38	NOLANGA TRADING ENTERPRISE	LEVEL 1
12	R 6,915,751.09	MOZ GOLD CC T/A ILANGA SECURITY	LEVEL 2
13	R 10,853,366.92	MADUNA PROTECTION SERVICES	LEVEL 1
14	R 3,942,329.85	E.L.GONDOR TRADING	LEVEL 1
15	R 6,855,162.11	WENZILE PHAPHAMA TRADING AND PROJECT	LEVEL 4
16	R 12,151,344.13	ROYAL SECURITY CC	LEVEL 3
17	R 9,858,819.02	PANGELA SECURITY SERVICES	LEVEL 3
18	R 2,660,365.71	BILLY AND SONS CIVIL AND SECURITY	LEVEL 1
19	R 10,311,080.85	RISING STAR PROTECTION SERVICE	LEVEL 1
20	R 8,202,593.88	ZACKS BUSINESS ENTER JV SEBELA SECURITY	NON COMPLIANT
21	R 5,926,329.83	RRA TRADING CC	LEVEL 3
22	NO BID PRICE ON COVER PAGE	MAXI PHUMELELA SECURITY	NON COMPLIANT
23	R 7,143,835.16	TYEKS SECURITY SERVICES	LEVEL 1
24	R 14,926,156.80	MR POPO PROTECTION SERVICES	LEVEL 1
25	R 2,027,409.18	VENUS SECURITY SOLUTIONS	LEVEL 4
26	R 10,187,435.94	SPHANDILE TRADING ENTERPRISE	LEVEL 1
27	NO BID PRICE ON COVER PAGE	TLHOMPHANANG ENTERPRISES CC	LEVEL 1
28	NO BID PRICE	XJ SSS SECURITY SERVICES	LEVEL 3

29	R 3,808,298.96	GOOD WORK SECURITY AND SERVICES	LEVEL 1
30	R 3,847,179.03	WILL TO WIN SECURITY AND TRADING ENTERPRISE	LEVEL 1
31	R 3,813,913.05	NOMNGWENYA SECURITY AND TRADING CC	LEVEL 3
32	R 17,329,836.00	MCJE TRADING AND PROJECTS	LEVEL 1
33	R 3,364,593.48	IDLANGAMANDLA SECURITY PROTECTION AND PROJECTS	LEVEL 1
34	NO BID PRICE ON COVER PAGE	MOCHOCHONONO SAMABANDLA JV	NON COMPLIANT
35	NO BID PRICE ON COVER PAGE	COGNIZANT SECURITY	LEVEL 3
36	R 1,601,707.41	TRITIC PROTECTION SERVICES	LEVEL 1
37	R 2,857,998.78	KHAYALAMI SECURITY CC	LEVEL 1
38	R 6,629,427.60	SIDAS SECURITY SERVICES	LEVEL 2
39	R 6,728,637.17	NONJABULO SECURITY SERVICES AND PROJECTS	LEVEL 3
40	R 115,731.17	MABALANE CONSTRUCTOR SUPPLIES	LEVEL 1
41	R 1,487,122.20	THEMBANATHI SERVICES	LEVEL 1
42	R 3,816,267.12	MARSHAL NIGHTS SECURITY SERVICES	LEVEL 3
43	NO BID PRICE ON COVER PAGE	RAITE SECURITY SERVICES AND CONSULTING	LEVEL 1
44	R 2,571,179.13	LL SECURITY SERVICES CC	LEVEL 1
45	R 10,183,653.26	MAFOKO SECURITY PATROLS	LEVEL 1